
[[380415]] VOLVO EC305CL 110686 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP408491
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 380415

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY- BYRON CENTER8840 BYRON COMMERCE DR SWBYRON CENTER, MIUS  49315Contact: BRIAN RESERbrian.reser@altaequipment.comT: (616)878-7450F: (616)878-7650
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommendthat you drain the oil and perform afilter service on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. Test forglycol is positive. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0046Unique No: 10701660Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 24 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 05984365 (Generated: 10/25/2023 13:39:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRIAN RESER - VOLVO0046

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408491 VCP405731 --- ---Sample Date 05 Oct 2023 12 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 4660 4370 --- ---Oil Hours 400 300 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 15.2 11.8 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 43.2 9.0 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 71 67 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 73 43 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 44 54 --- ---Glycol % 0.10 NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.2 --- ---Silicon ppm 13 29 --- ---Sodium ppm 456 6 --- ---Potassium ppm 339 11 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 14 --- ---Copper ppm 13 5 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 54 54 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 9 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1643 1573 --- ---Magnesium ppm 512 446 --- ---Zinc ppm 1226 1071 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 973 893 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 86 107 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 05984365 (Generated: 10/25/2023 13:39:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRIAN RESER - VOLVO0046
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC305CL 110686\Diesel Engine [VCP408491] 05 Oct 2023 @ 4660.0 hrs

