
[[620889]] VOLVO A45G 352039 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435112
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 620889

ORANGE COUNTY SOLID WASTE5901 YOUNG PINE ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: MICHAEL BEEBEmichael.beebe@ocfl.netT: (407)836-6652F: (407)836-6650
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ORAORLUnique No: 10701740Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 20 Oct 2023
Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 05984445 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:40:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435112 VCP405095 VCP381257 VCP377486Sample Date 17 Oct 2023 18 Mar 2023 29 Oct 2022 23 Apr 2022Machine Hours 8196 6836 6327 5423Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 12.3 12.9 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 9.5 9.6 10.2Oxidation (PA) % 87 87 95 92
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.7 0.5 0.7 0.6Nitration (PA) % 83 80 93 81Sulfation (PA) % 64 64 70 69Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 3.5 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 7 6 5Sodium ppm 2 3 4 <1Potassium ppm 2 0 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 12 11 9Copper ppm 2 2 2 4Lead ppm 3 1 2 2Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 5 3 3 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 46 42 41 41Nickel ppm 1 1 <1 2Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1713 1721 1691 1831Magnesium ppm 464 527 488 547Zinc ppm 1150 1122 1098 1124Phosphorus ppm 933 919 904 978Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 17 28 16 20

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 05984445 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:40:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352039\Diesel Engine [VCP435112] 17 Oct 2023 @ 8196.0 hrs

