
VOLVO A45G 352022 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP409178
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

DUNN CONSTRUCTION INC318 N 14TH STBELLEVUE, IAUS  52031Contact: STEVE DUNNDUNNCONSTRUCTINC@GMAIL.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: DUNBELUnique No: 10702397Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 05985102 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:32:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409178 VCP396632 --- ---Sample Date 18 Sep 2023 22 Mar 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 5727 4482 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.0 43.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 19 19 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 75 65 --- ---Copper ppm 101 88 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 5 4 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3676 3742 --- ---Magnesium ppm 47 52 --- ---Zinc ppm 1590 1554 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1281 1300 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 117 129 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 05985102 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:32:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352022\Wet Disc Brake [VCP409178] 18 Sep 2023 @ 5727.0 hrs

