
VOLVO A45G 353298 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP399511
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No:

DUNN CONSTRUCTION INC318 N 14TH STBELLEVUE, IAUS  52031Contact: STEVE DUNNDUNNCONSTRUCTINC@GMAIL.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DUNBELUnique No: 10702401Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 05985106 (Generated: 10/23/2023 10:39:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399511 VCP409133 VCP409127 VCP391377Sample Date 18 Sep 2023 05 Jul 2023 05 Jul 2023 22 Mar 2023Machine Hours 1722 1325 1328 757Oil Hours 0 0 500 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL --- --- NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 113 48.1 --- 52.9Visc @ 100°C cSt --- --- 12.7 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 30 6 46Sodium ppm 0 2 2 9Potassium ppm 2 3 4 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 70 105 15 115Copper ppm 2 6 14 5Lead ppm 0 <1 1 0Tin ppm 0 0 1 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 <1Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 7 8 9 12Nickel ppm <1 <1 5 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 14 72 1416 49Magnesium ppm 1 <1 635 1Zinc ppm 36 173 860 70Phosphorus ppm 601 1341 694 2295Barium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Boron ppm 38 29 27 198

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 05985106 (Generated: 10/23/2023 10:39:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353298\Drop Box [VCP399511] 18 Sep 2023 @ 1722.0 hrs

