
[[19871 TGP]] VOLVO EC250EL 310539 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP441554
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 19871 TGP

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Moderateconcentration of visible metalpresent. Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10702424Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05985129 (Generated: 10/24/2023 18:15:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441554 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5406 --- --- ---Oil Hours 910 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 408 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 1318 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 30 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4860 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 168 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 35 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 16 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 36 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 30 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 8 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 994 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 150 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05985129 (Generated: 10/24/2023 18:15:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 310539\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP441554] 12 Oct 2023 @ 5406.0 hrs

