
[[19793 KOPPERS-LELAND]] VOLVO L150H 6856 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP441588
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 19793 KOPPERS-LELAND

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10702477Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05985182 (Generated: 10/26/2023 20:55:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441588 VCP426894 VCP421460 VCP313936Sample Date 28 Sep 2023 13 Jul 2023 03 May 2023 11 Aug 2021Machine Hours 6473 6021 5629 2042Oil Hours 0 0 1635 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.9 42.0 41.9 42.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 18 12 14Sodium ppm 0 3 2 10Potassium ppm 2 0 2 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 25 30 21 63Copper ppm 17 14 10 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 0 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 3 3 0Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4059 4127 3908 4428Magnesium ppm 16 19 15 14Zinc ppm 1688 1664 1601 1718Phosphorus ppm 1363 1359 1289 1450Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 133 138 125 123

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05985182 (Generated: 10/26/2023 20:55:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6856\Rear Axle [VCP441588] 28 Sep 2023 @ 6473.0 hrs

