
[[19764 LANE-BLYTHE]] VOLVO A45G FS 352463 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP441376
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 19764 LANE-BLYTHE

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10702494Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05985199 (Generated: 10/26/2023 20:53:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441376 VCP418626 VCP331007 ---Sample Date 05 Oct 2023 07 Jun 2023 16 Jun 2022 ---Machine Hours 4306 3658 2321 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 178 177 179 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 5 3 ---Sodium ppm 0 2 2 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 163 202 200 ---Copper ppm 2 1 1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 <1 ---Chromium ppm 2 3 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 5 6 7 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 14 16 13 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 95 55 58 ---Magnesium ppm 5 2 3 ---Zinc ppm 38 20 27 ---Phosphorus ppm 1017 1027 1000 ---Barium ppm <1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 155 178 158 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05985199 (Generated: 10/26/2023 20:53:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G FS 352463\Front Axle [VCP441376] 05 Oct 2023 @ 4306.0 hrs

