
VOLVO A45G 353298 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP399777
Oil Type: ATF
Job No:

DUNN CONSTRUCTION INC318 N 14TH STBELLEVUE, IAUS  52031Contact: STEVE DUNNDUNNCONSTRUCTINC@GMAIL.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: DUNBELUnique No: 10702510Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 05985215 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:33:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399777 VCP396939 VCP365368 ---Sample Date 18 Sep 2023 22 Mar 2023 03 Jan 2023 ---Machine Hours 1722 757 400 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.4 27.7 28.0 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 18 14 25 ---Sodium ppm 2 4 4 ---Potassium ppm 4 2 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 54 38 38 ---Copper ppm 45 25 18 ---Lead ppm <1 0 0 ---Tin ppm 6 2 2 ---Aluminum ppm 27 13 13 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 ---Nickel ppm 5 3 2 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 4 4 3 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 126 103 74 ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 0 ---Zinc ppm 11 8 3 ---Phosphorus ppm 224 250 193 ---Barium ppm 1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 90 105 85 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 05985215 (Generated: 10/26/2023 21:33:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353298\Transmission [VCP399777] 18 Sep 2023 @ 1722.0 hrs

