
[[2675-1]] VOLVO A40G 342441 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP429156
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 2675-1

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - BRIDGEVILLE17941 SUSSEX HIGHWAYBRIDGEVILLE, DEUS  19933Contact: MATT CLARKMCLARK@mcclung-logan.comT: (302)337-3400F: (302)337-9083
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1023Unique No: 10702531Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1023 [WUSCAR] 05985236 (Generated: 10/27/2023 00:36:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT CLARK - VOLVO1023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429156 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5519 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 159 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 39 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 185 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 73 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1023 [WUSCAR] 05985236 (Generated: 10/27/2023 00:36:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT CLARK - VOLVO1023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342441\Transmission (Auto) [VCP429156] 13 Oct 2023 @ 5519.0 hrs

