
VOLVO A40G 352507 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP318563
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
 

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10708808Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05986146 (Generated: 10/25/2023 11:00:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP318563 VCP408603 --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 16 Jun 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 4221 3596 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 12.0 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.5 9.5 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 69 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 77 60 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 58 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.3 --- ---Silicon ppm 5 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 2 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 5 --- ---Copper ppm 23 20 --- ---Lead ppm 2 0 --- ---Tin ppm 1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 7 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 51 56 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1630 1799 --- ---Magnesium ppm 635 690 --- ---Zinc ppm 1199 1325 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 958 1053 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 32 100 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05986146 (Generated: 10/25/2023 11:00:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352507\Diesel Engine [VCP318563] 20 Oct 2023 @ 4221.0 hrs

