
[[Z37246]] VOLVO A25G 752299 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP414296
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: Z37246

DIPROINDUCA USA LIMITED2528 MEDINA RDMEDINA, OHUS  44256Contact: MATT GILLILANDmgilliland@diproinduca.comT: (225)571-0603F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DIPMEDUnique No: 10709640Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Oct 2023
Report Id: DIPMED [WUSCAR] 05986978 (Generated: 10/25/2023 13:23:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT GILLILAND - DIPMED

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414296 VCP401765 VCP390798 VCP361488Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 24 Aug 2023 30 Mar 2023 07 Sep 2022Machine Hours 5905 5368 3980 2151Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 144 139 141 135
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm <1 <1 1 2Sodium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 34 47 94Copper ppm 1 3 3 11Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 1 4Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 2 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 8 50 38 153Magnesium ppm <1 3 9 0Zinc ppm 0 14 19 72Phosphorus ppm 976 1013 1013 994Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 204 213 201 269

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DIPMED [WUSCAR] 05986978 (Generated: 10/25/2023 13:23:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT GILLILAND - DIPMED
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752299\Front Axle [VCP414296] 18 Oct 2023 @ 5905.0 hrs

