
VOLVO L90E 66774 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP442080
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

TOWN OF SOUTHINGTON75 MAIN STSOUTHINGTON, CTUS  06489Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the reported slipping.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: TOWSOUCTUnique No: 10709676Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Oct 2023
Report Id: TOWSOUCT [WUSCAR] 05987014 (Generated: 10/25/2023 14:54:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - TOWSOUCT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442080 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 21203 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 137 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 8 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 203 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 87 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOWSOUCT [WUSCAR] 05987014 (Generated: 10/25/2023 14:54:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - TOWSOUCT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90E 66774\Transmission (Auto) [VCP442080] 17 Oct 2023 @ 21203.0 hrs

