
[[F02709 PJ KEATING]] VOLVO EC750E 314081 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426828
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: F02709 PJ KEATING

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC31 JAMES P. MURPHY INDUSTRIAL HWYWEST WARWICK, RIUS  02893Contact: NORMAN VINCENTnorman.vincent@chadwick-baross.comT: (401)328-6967F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. (aux bearing failure).Allcomponent wear rates are normal.The wear metal levels do not reflectthe reported failure. Elemental levelof silicon (Si) above normal. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: CHAWESRIUnique No: 10710608Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Oct 2023
Report Id: CHAWESRI [WUSCAR] 05987946 (Generated: 10/26/2023 13:23:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NORMAN VINCENT - CHAWESRI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426828 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2698 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 54 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 168 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 16 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 239 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1416 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 788 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1078 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 891 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 276 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHAWESRI [WUSCAR] 05987946 (Generated: 10/26/2023 13:24:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NORMAN VINCENT - CHAWESRI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC750E 314081\Diesel Engine [VCP426828] 14 Sep 2023 @ 2698.0 hrs

