
[[9825]] VOLVO L180H 5472 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426371
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9825

RELIABLE CONTRACTING2410 EVERGREEN RD SUITE 200GAMBRILLS, MDUS  21054Contact: RUSSELL HATFIELDRHATFIELD@RELIABLECONTRACTING.COMT: (410)987-1851F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: RELMILUnique No: 10711611Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 26 Oct 2023
Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 05988949 (Generated: 10/27/2023 23:21:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426371 VCP408907 VCP404395 VCP366666Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 19 Jun 2023 22 Mar 2023 08 Sep 2022Machine Hours 4170 3566 3095 2104Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.1 13.0 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.2 7.5 8.0 8.6Oxidation (PA) % 62 64 56 72
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 58 58 73 69Sulfation (PA) % 60 61 52 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 6 6Sodium ppm 2 <1 3 2Potassium ppm 0 <1 2 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 5 7 7Copper ppm <1 <1 2 2Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 1 1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 4Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 86 90 109 123Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1403 1496 1648 1389Magnesium ppm 406 468 587 487Zinc ppm 1295 1275 1013 1021Phosphorus ppm 982 1043 796 844Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 330 369 245 372

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 05988949 (Generated: 10/27/2023 23:21:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5472\Diesel Engine [VCP426371] 20 Oct 2023 @ 4170.0 hrs

