
[[A11326]] VOLVO A30C 60035 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP430661
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A11326

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 10711773Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 27 Oct 2023
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05989111 (Generated: 10/27/2023 12:22:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430661 VCP383615 VCP264310 VCP217286Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 21 Nov 2022 06 Apr 2020 29 Mar 2018Machine Hours 21415 20899 19940 18910Oil Hours 500 0 500 1500Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.7 45.1 43.6 43.64Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.91 0.87 0.696 0.720
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 10661 43759 22354 15048Particles >6µm 2066 12889 5703 4176Particles >14µm 97 1096 140 293ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/14 23/21/17 22/20/14 21/19/15Silicon ppm 12 6 5 5Sodium ppm 0 0 2 2Potassium ppm 2 1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 4 3 3Copper ppm 2 4 2 1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 4 2 1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 2 1 <1 1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1730 1158 701 847Magnesium ppm 67 63 53 82Zinc ppm 921 823 679 752Phosphorus ppm 734 652 555 626Barium ppm 3 0 0 0Boron ppm 18 5 5 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05989111 (Generated: 10/27/2023 12:22:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30C 60035\Hydraulic System [VCP430661] 20 Oct 2023 @ 21415.0 hrs

