
VOLVO L90H 625028 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP440746
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - CLAYTON60 SADISCO RDCLAYTON, NCUS  27520Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: INSCLAUnique No: 10712159Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 26 Oct 2023
Report Id: INSCLA [WUSCAR] 05989497 (Generated: 10/26/2023 15:49:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - INSCLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440746 VCP421830 VCP418495 VCP410367Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 03 Aug 2023 28 Jun 2023 18 May 2023Machine Hours 8015 7570 7360 5956Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.8 42.9 41.6 39.7
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 14 10 12Sodium ppm 3 3 8 9Potassium ppm 0 0 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 30 31 82 121Copper ppm 6 4 15 2Lead ppm <1 <1 4 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 2Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3821 4431 3752 4041Magnesium ppm 14 17 17 24Zinc ppm 1573 1737 1619 1668Phosphorus ppm 1245 1398 1353 1298Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 128 164 123 124

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSCLA [WUSCAR] 05989497 (Generated: 10/26/2023 15:49:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - INSCLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625028\Rear Axle [VCP440746] 18 Oct 2023 @ 8015.0 hrs

