
VOLVO A25G VCP 413192 (S/N NOT GIVEN) - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP432751
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10712164Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 27 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05989502 (Generated: 10/27/2023 15:45:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432751 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4800 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 122 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 64 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 224 --- --- ---Copper ppm 28 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 109 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 58 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 995 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 171 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05989502 (Generated: 10/27/2023 15:45:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G VCP 413192 (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Rear Axle [VCP432751] 24 Oct 2023 @ 4800.0 hrs

