
[[A11205]] VOLVO ECR235 314555 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP440554
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No: A11205

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10712196Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 27 Oct 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05989534 (Generated: 10/27/2023 14:30:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440554 VCP361440 VCP310364 ---Sample Date 13 Oct 2023 02 May 2022 28 Jul 2021 ---Machine Hours 2475 1178 520 ---Oil Hours 1000 0 520 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 311 312 182 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 4 10 ---Sodium ppm <1 0 2 ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 51 27 192 ---Copper ppm 4 3 13 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm <1 <1 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 27 21 4 ---Magnesium ppm 3 3 1 ---Zinc ppm 2 7 11 ---Phosphorus ppm 980 1037 312 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 165 201 16 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05989534 (Generated: 10/27/2023 14:30:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235 314555\Swing Drive [VCP440554] 13 Oct 2023 @ 2475.0 hrs

