
[[11335]] VOLVO EC220D 210516 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP430936
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 11335

WASTE MANAGEMENT5245 BLEIGH AVEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19136Contact: JERRY SAUTERgsauterj@wm.comT: (610)636-4994F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WASPHIUnique No: 10712200Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 26 Oct 2023
Report Id: WASPHI [WUSCAR] 05989538 (Generated: 10/26/2023 16:35:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JERRY SAUTER - WASPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430936 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 18596 --- --- ---Oil Hours 18596 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 297 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 45 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 42 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 993 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 185 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASPHI [WUSCAR] 05989538 (Generated: 10/26/2023 16:35:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JERRY SAUTER - WASPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220D 210516\Front Right Final Drive [VCP430936] 20 Oct 2023 @ 18596.0 hrs

