
[[SPM619831]] VOLVO EC380E 315082 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414543
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM619831

UNITED SCRAP1545 S CICERO AVECICERO, ILUS  60804Contact: RON LUCHTENBURGrluchten@unitedscrap.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: UNICICILUnique No: 10712803Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05990141 (Generated: 10/31/2023 19:33:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414543 VCP420645 VCP418538 VCP405711Sample Date 11 Oct 2023 13 Jul 2023 02 May 2023 16 Mar 2023Machine Hours 3862 3213 2700 2412Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.7 12.1 12.3 12.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.6 8.2 8.9 7.8Oxidation (PA) % 76 65 61 64
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 73 63 55 69Sulfation (PA) % 58 55 53 55Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.4Silicon ppm 7 5 4 4Sodium ppm 3 3 2 2Potassium ppm 3 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 8 5 5Copper ppm 3 3 2 8Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 0Molybdenum ppm 59 62 60 55Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1068 1152 1131 1101Magnesium ppm 866 1007 1008 843Zinc ppm 1173 1267 1300 1104Phosphorus ppm 936 1061 1052 922Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 2 3 0 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05990141 (Generated: 10/31/2023 19:33:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380E 315082\Diesel Engine [VCP414543] 11 Oct 2023 @ 3862.0 hrs

