
[[SPM619899]] VOLVO EC380E 310775 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP413058
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM619899

UNITED SCRAP1545 S CICERO AVECICERO, ILUS  60804Contact: RON LUCHTENBURGrluchten@unitedscrap.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: UNICICILUnique No: 10713337Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Oct 2023
Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05990675 (Generated: 10/30/2023 11:42:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413058 VCP383235 VCP387428 VCP325811Sample Date 12 Oct 2023 22 Feb 2023 16 Nov 2022 21 Sep 2021Machine Hours 22964 20570 19763 16084Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 201 134 164 194
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 6.75 0.113 0.792 1.25Silicon ppm 26 17 12 26Sodium ppm 0 <1 2 7Potassium ppm 5 3 3 14
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 189 118 548 233Copper ppm 12 4 12 70Lead ppm 2 0 0 2Tin ppm 3 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 3 2 4 8Chromium ppm 2 2 6 3Molybdenum ppm 0 1 1 1Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 5 2 3 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm 3 1 6 6Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2552 2142 341 2001Magnesium ppm 51 30 9 26Zinc ppm 977 819 155 861Phosphorus ppm 1164 945 1847 835Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 48 33 37 15

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 05990675 (Generated: 10/30/2023 11:42:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380E 310775\Swing Drive [VCP413058] 12 Oct 2023 @ 22964.0 hrs

