
[[SPM620293]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2078 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415055
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM620293

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10713352Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Oct 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05990690 (Generated: 10/30/2023 12:00:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415055 VCP418504 VCP387357 VCP378257Sample Date 12 Oct 2023 19 May 2023 02 Mar 2023 16 May 2022Machine Hours 19841 19056 18536 17503Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 158 189 191 180
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 107 57 45 13Sodium ppm 6 4 2 <1Potassium ppm 12 6 5 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 626 476 394 216Copper ppm 50 23 14 5Lead ppm 2 0 1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 25 10 5 2Chromium ppm 4 3 3 1Molybdenum ppm 0 1 2 1Nickel ppm 2 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 4 2 2 <1Silver ppm <1 0 <1 2Manganese ppm 9 6 5 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 879 1989 1987 1586Magnesium ppm 95 47 33 8Zinc ppm 384 860 798 683Phosphorus ppm 1049 896 865 747Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 155 33 29 42

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05990690 (Generated: 10/30/2023 12:00:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2078\Front Left Final Drive [VCP415055] 12 Oct 2023 @ 19841.0 hrs

