
[[SPM606511]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2733 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415242
Oil Type: MOBIL SHC 630
Job No: SPM606511

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Note thatthere appears to be a discrepancy inthe total time on this component,when compared to the historicaldata. NOTE: one of two samplesreceived with same ID and samplingdate.Bearing and/or bushing wear isindicated. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10713388Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Oct 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05990726 (Generated: 10/30/2023 15:15:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415242 VCP415096 VCP423157 VCP382559Sample Date 19 Oct 2023 19 Oct 2023 18 Jul 2023 24 Apr 2023Machine Hours 15132 7319 6795 6276Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 189 161 201 207
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.727 --- 0.261 ---Silicon ppm 20 17 19 17Sodium ppm 0 0 <1 1Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 304 377 114 107Copper ppm 819 791 276 149Lead ppm 10 4 0 0Tin ppm 10 9 14 8Aluminum ppm 2 <1 2 1Chromium ppm 3 5 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 2 1Nickel ppm 1 1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 4 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2254 2029 2253 1940Magnesium ppm 34 32 22 16Zinc ppm 882 781 1143 1047Phosphorus ppm 886 822 853 783Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 23 8 4 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 05990726 (Generated: 10/30/2023 15:16:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2733\Right Swing Drive [VCP415242] 19 Oct 2023 @ 15132.0 hrs

