
VOLVO A45G 352853 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423716
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 15W40
Job No:

J.M. HUBER10322 HWY 53 EMARBLE HILL, GAUS  30148Contact: GEORGE GIBSONgeorge.gibson@huber.comT: (770)893-7602F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: JMHMARUnique No: 10713540Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 05990878 (Generated: 10/31/2023 17:40:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423716 VCP386271 VCP331711 VCP324504Sample Date 20 Jun 2023 01 Mar 2023 01 Jul 2022 05 Apr 2022Machine Hours 4275 3434 2868 2075Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.7 12.6 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.5 9.2 6.4 6.4Oxidation (PA) % 63 75 64 67
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1.2 0.6 0.9 0.8Nitration (PA) % 83 63 75 74Sulfation (PA) % 62 61 66 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 5 5 5Sodium ppm 4 2 3 1Potassium ppm 2 2 1 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 15 14 13Copper ppm 10 13 36 74Lead ppm 3 1 3 2Tin ppm 1 <1 2 2Aluminum ppm 5 3 3 2Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 52 43 41 15Nickel ppm 6 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1777 1749 1899 2215Magnesium ppm 325 420 302 120Zinc ppm 1149 1132 1147 1187Phosphorus ppm 1014 933 925 943Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 17 43 66 54

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 05990878 (Generated: 10/31/2023 17:40:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352853\Diesel Engine [VCP423716] 20 Jun 2023 @ 4275.0 hrs

