
[[SWA391982 MOEN TRANS]] VOLVO L120H 632758 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP365455
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA391982 MOEN TRANS

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We recommendthat you drain the oil and perform afilter service on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount offuel present in the oil. Fuel is presentin the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The BN level is low. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10713543Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05990881 (Generated: 10/31/2023 19:51:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP365455 VCP404171 VCP379177 ---Sample Date 24 Oct 2023 14 Feb 2023 23 Jun 2022 ---Machine Hours 7565 5697 3981 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 5.4 15.3 14.9 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 3.5 10.4 7.9 ---Oxidation (PA) % 164 55 86 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.7 0.1 1.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 83 43 89 ---Sulfation (PA) % 85 50 68 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 49.1 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 19 5 25 ---Sodium ppm 4 0 2 ---Potassium ppm 2 1 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 1 31 ---Copper ppm 2 0 3 ---Lead ppm 2 0 3 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 2 ---Aluminum ppm 11 2 17 ---Chromium ppm 2 0 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 38 56 67 ---Nickel ppm 1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 666 1133 1828 ---Magnesium ppm 605 817 583 ---Zinc ppm 797 1131 1503 ---Phosphorus ppm 680 991 1203 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 0 4 26 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05990881 (Generated: 10/31/2023 19:51:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632758\Diesel Engine [VCP365455] 24 Oct 2023 @ 7565.0 hrs

