
VOLVO A45G 67 (S/N 342048) - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP423707
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

J.M. HUBER10322 HWY 53 EMARBLE HILL, GAUS  30148Contact: GEORGE GIBSONgeorge.gibson@huber.comT: (770)893-7602F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: JMHMARUnique No: 10713949Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 30 Oct 2023
Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 05991287 (Generated: 10/30/2023 15:20:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423707 VCP400446 VCP396282 VCP323858Sample Date 07 Jun 2023 14 Mar 2023 16 Nov 2022 16 May 2022Machine Hours 0 13996 13328 11709Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.1 43.8 44.1 44.0
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 11 14 14Sodium ppm 0 2 6 7Potassium ppm 3 2 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 37 27 42 30Copper ppm 61 62 88 80Lead ppm 0 <1 2 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 1 1Nickel ppm <1 <1 1 1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3746 3382 4171 3926Magnesium ppm 16 15 26 22Zinc ppm 1507 1424 1701 1576Phosphorus ppm 1281 1261 1341 1343Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 136 106 128 126

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 05991287 (Generated: 10/30/2023 15:20:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 67 (S/N 342048)\Brake Cooling System [VCP423707] 07 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

