
[[SW1025599 BALCONES]] VOLVO L120H 633369 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423048
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SW1025599 BALCONES

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10714104Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05991442 (Generated: 10/30/2023 16:16:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423048 VCP412436 VCP406915 ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 21 Aug 2023 24 May 2023 ---Machine Hours 1954 1436 581 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.3 12.2 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 7.1 9.1 ---Oxidation (PA) % 86 109 87 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.4 0.3 ---Nitration (PA) % 60 69 53 ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 70 63 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 1.6 ---Silicon ppm 20 29 24 ---Sodium ppm 2 5 5 ---Potassium ppm <1 4 4 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 30 31 ---Copper ppm 11 34 18 ---Lead ppm 4 8 4 ---Tin ppm 2 4 3 ---Aluminum ppm 4 12 47 ---Chromium ppm <1 2 4 ---Molybdenum ppm 48 46 52 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 3 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1132 1586 1840 ---Magnesium ppm 777 605 771 ---Zinc ppm 1130 1182 1428 ---Phosphorus ppm 918 920 1174 ---Barium ppm 0 0 2 ---Boron ppm 11 20 62 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05991442 (Generated: 10/30/2023 16:16:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633369\Diesel Engine [VCP423048] 20 Oct 2023 @ 1954.0 hrs

