
[[D44649 WI IND SAND]] BROCE BROOM RJ-350 405077 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP407311
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: D44649 WI IND SAND

ARING EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - EAU CLAIREPO BOX 478EAU CLAIRE, WIUS  54702Contact: BRYAN KIRCHNERbkirchner@aring.comT: (715)835-6133F: (715)835-1230
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou follow the water drain-offprocedure for this component, anduse off-line filtration to improve thecleanliness of the system fluid. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. There is toomuch water present in this sample toperform a particle count.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0071Unique No: 10714235Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0071 [WUSCAR] 05991573 (Generated: 10/30/2023 17:08:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRYAN KIRCHNER - VOLVO0071

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407311 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1251 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.4 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.34 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.49 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 77 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 487 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 413 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0071 [WUSCAR] 05991573 (Generated: 10/30/2023 17:08:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRYAN KIRCHNER - VOLVO0071
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	BROCE BROOM BROCE BROOM RJ-350 405077\Hydraulic System [VCP407311] 26 Oct 2023 @ 1251.0 hrs

