
[[SPM621030]] SENNEBOGEN 850E 850.0.3178 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP429503
Oil Type: MOBIL 220
Job No: SPM621030

FERROUS PROCESSING AND TRADING3400 E LAFAYETTEDETROIT, MIUS  48207Contact: KEITH HALLkeith.hall@fpt1.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: FERDETUnique No: 10714496Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: FERDET [WUSCAR] 05991834 (Generated: 10/31/2023 12:09:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH HALL - FERDET

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429503 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 217 --- --- ---Oil Hours 217 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 219 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.248 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 155 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 0 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 18 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 327 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 17 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FERDET [WUSCAR] 05991834 (Generated: 10/31/2023 12:09:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH HALL - FERDET
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 850E 850.0.3178\Left Swing Drive [VCP429503] 23 Oct 2023 @ 217.0 hrs

