
[[SWO-066738]] VOLVO A45G 352799 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP433495
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWO-066738

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10715076Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05992414 (Generated: 11/02/2023 14:33:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433495 VCP419148 VCP405249 VCP369489Sample Date 25 Oct 2023 12 Jul 2023 29 Mar 2023 16 Nov 2022Machine Hours 4451 3946 3445 2976Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.3 27.2 25.6 28.9
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 20 4 5 5Sodium ppm 2 2 2 2Potassium ppm 3 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 18 11 25Copper ppm 25 15 7 14Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 2 1 <1 2Aluminum ppm 13 8 4 8Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 0Nickel ppm 4 1 <1 2Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 73 93 67 66Magnesium ppm 1 3 4 1Zinc ppm 3 9 0 1Phosphorus ppm 209 216 200 214Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 98 102 96 90

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05992414 (Generated: 11/02/2023 14:34:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352799\Transmission (Auto) [VCP433495] 25 Oct 2023 @ 4451.0 hrs

