
[[24245]] VOLVO A40G 352430 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP433231
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 24245

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Note that there appears to be adiscrepancy in the total time on thiscomponent, when compared to thehistorical data.Piston, ring andcylinder wear is indicated. Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 10715331Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 05992669 (Generated: 10/31/2023 14:11:12) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433231 VCP384007 VCP365510 VCP378370Sample Date 24 Oct 2023 08 Jun 2023 14 Sep 2022 19 May 2022Machine Hours 1069 4133 3532 3064Oil Hours 1000 1000 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 12.8 12.8 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.9 10.2 10.8 7.8Oxidation (PA) % 86 80 60 57
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.8 0.5 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 94 71 84 69Sulfation (PA) % 64 66 58 51Glycol % NEG NEG 0.10 NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 18 7 12 5Sodium ppm 6 208 759 225Potassium ppm 3 132 418 29
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 62 18 13 10Copper ppm 35 6 2 2Lead ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 4 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 106 8 2 2Chromium ppm 6 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 31 55 96 63Nickel ppm <1 11 2 1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 1 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 3 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1482 1557 1069 1118Magnesium ppm 514 515 877 984Zinc ppm 1077 1122 1165 1261Phosphorus ppm 927 949 1000 1083Barium ppm 15 0 0 0Boron ppm 29 32 11 8

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 05992669 (Generated: 10/31/2023 14:11:15) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352430\Diesel Engine [VCP433231] 24 Oct 2023 @ 1069.0 hrs

