
[[399094]] VOLVO L120H 632528 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP434077
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 399094

FORESTRY RESOURCES4353 MICHIGAN LINKFORT MYERS, FLUS  33916Contact: COREY MUELLER
T: (239)872-1856F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Theamount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: FORFORTFLUnique No: 10715449Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 31 Oct 2023
Report Id: FORFORTFL [WUSCAR] 05992787 (Generated: 10/31/2023 14:58:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: COREY MUELLER - FORFORTFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434077 VCP427060 VCP399288 VCP376951Sample Date 26 Oct 2023 20 Jun 2023 04 Jan 2023 09 Aug 2022Machine Hours 11506 10902 9678 8817Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 54.0 53.8 49.9 51.4Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 0.35 0.31 0.33
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 3005 5061 1454 3798Particles >6µm 500 748 350 395Particles >14µm 23 55 37 55ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/16/12 20/17/13 18/16/12 19/16/13Silicon ppm 2 2 1 2Sodium ppm 0 1 <1 1Potassium ppm 1 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 4 2 2Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 0 0 <1Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 4Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 514 465 161 151Magnesium ppm 20 16 20 19Zinc ppm 483 427 380 378Phosphorus ppm 402 379 314 312Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 13 12 3 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FORFORTFL [WUSCAR] 05992787 (Generated: 10/31/2023 14:58:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: COREY MUELLER - FORFORTFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632528\Hydraulic System [VCP434077] 26 Oct 2023 @ 11506.0 hrs

