
[[S50601222]] VOLVO L120H 632129 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP403618
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: S50601222

SHAW ENVIRONMENTAL - APTIM GOVT SOLUTIONS16406 US 224 EASTFINDLAY, OHUS  45840Contact: TODD HICKStodd.hicks@shawgrp.comT: (419)425-6248F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHAFINOHUnique No: 10722181Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 01 Nov 2023
Report Id: SHAFINOH [WUSCAR] 05993821 (Generated: 11/01/2023 10:23:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD HICKS - SHAFINOH

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP403618 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3800 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 37.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 94 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3467 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1436 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1331 --- --- ---Barium ppm 21 --- --- ---Boron ppm 38 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHAFINOH [WUSCAR] 05993821 (Generated: 11/01/2023 10:23:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD HICKS - SHAFINOH
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632129\Front Axle [VCP403618] 24 Oct 2023 @ 3800.0 hrs

