
[[X21386 CRH]] VOLVO L220H 2898 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP409930
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: X21386 CRH

HOUSBY HEAVY EQUIPMENTPO BOX 1846CEDAR RAPIDS, IAUS  52406Contact: JUSTIN JOHNSONJJOHNSON@HOUSBY.COMT: F: (319)365-2525
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0074Unique No: 10722627Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0074 [WUSCAR] 05994267 (Generated: 11/01/2023 13:00:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN JOHNSON - VOLVO0074

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409930 VCP404653 VCP405867 VCP385025Sample Date 26 Oct 2023 24 Aug 2023 31 May 2023 20 Oct 2022Machine Hours 6315 6028 5556 4994Oil Hours 0 2000 500 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 41.2 41.5 42.0Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.30 0.35 0.33 0.37
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 46382 4525 10492 8922Particles >6µm 356 1350 2809 1956Particles >14µm 7 117 110 150ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/16/10 19/18/14 21/19/14 20/18/14Silicon ppm 4 4 3 3Sodium ppm 3 0 1 0Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 7 6 5Copper ppm 5 5 3 4Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 0 <1Chromium ppm 1 2 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 5 5 4 5Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 128 145 152 160Magnesium ppm 23 25 26 24Zinc ppm 433 466 496 466Phosphorus ppm 370 360 383 352Barium ppm 19 2 0 0Boron ppm 4 3 4 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0074 [WUSCAR] 05994267 (Generated: 11/01/2023 13:00:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN JOHNSON - VOLVO0074
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2898\Hydraulic System [VCP409930] 26 Oct 2023 @ 6315.0 hrs

