
[[20893]] VOLVO L60G 623293 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE254206
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 20893

520 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - KNOXVILLE5730 RUTLEDGE PIKEKNOXVILLE, TNUS  37924Contact: BRANDON GRANTbrandon.grant@ascendummachinery.comT: (865)525-1845F: (865)525-0251
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0124Unique No: 10723714Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 02 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0124 [WUSCAR] 05995354 (Generated: 11/02/2023 04:45:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON GRANT - VOLVO0124

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE254206 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 503 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 21 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 15 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 40 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1499 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 585 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1174 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 974 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 50 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0124 [WUSCAR] 05995354 (Generated: 11/02/2023 04:45:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON GRANT - VOLVO0124
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60G 623293\Diesel Engine [VCE254206] 27 Oct 2023 @ 503.0 hrs

