
[[E15091 SHANE KINSBUR]] VOLVO L120G 30219 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP388149
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: E15091 SHANE KINSBUR

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC314 MAIN STREETCARIBOU, MEUS  04736Contact: THOMAS PICKANCEthomas.pickance@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)227-2479F: (207)498-6596
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We advise that youcheck for the source of the coolantleak. We recommend that you drainthe oil and perform a filter service onthis component if not already done.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. Test for glycol is positive. Thereis a high concentration of glycolpresent in the oil. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0010Unique No: 10723724Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 05995364 (Generated: 11/03/2023 10:43:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: THOMAS PICKANCE - VOLVO0010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388149 VCP149320 VCE122024 VCE122347Sample Date 26 Oct 2023 23 Sep 2015 10 Apr 2015 10 Feb 2015Machine Hours 14614 12150 11692 11278Oil Hours 0 0 400 400Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE NORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.4 14.74 14.88 15.26Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 13.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 69 40 56 56
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.7 0.3 0.4 0.4Nitration (PA) % 97 50 67 67Sulfation (PA) % 75 44 58 61Glycol % 0.20 NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 47 6 4 9Sodium ppm 1501 64 75 101Potassium ppm 2117 9 4 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 82 29 36 71Copper ppm 36 1 2 3Lead ppm 7 <1 <1 2Tin ppm 4 0 1 2Aluminum ppm 56 13 11 24Chromium ppm 3 2 2 6Molybdenum ppm 69 55 56 60Nickel ppm 3 1 <1 2Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1942 1678 1679 1292Magnesium ppm 337 706 810 1224Zinc ppm 1342 1284 1350 1510Phosphorus ppm 2220 1036 1189 1235Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 143 43 48 27

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 05995364 (Generated: 11/03/2023 10:43:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: THOMAS PICKANCE - VOLVO0010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120G 30219\Diesel Engine [VCP388149] 26 Oct 2023 @ 14614.0 hrs

