
[[E15101 CRAIGE T]] ELTEC 2FHL277LR0257 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP418879
Oil Type: PONSSE 75W90
Job No: E15101 CRAIGE T

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC314 MAIN STREETCARIBOU, MEUS  04736Contact: ADAM THERIAULTtheriault@chadwick-baross.comT: F: (207)498-6596
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0010Unique No: 10724392Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 05996032 (Generated: 11/03/2023 11:54:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM THERIAULT - VOLVO0010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418879 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 307 --- --- ---Oil Hours 307 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 143 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 88 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 126 --- --- ---Copper ppm 34 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 18 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 447 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 99 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 05996032 (Generated: 11/03/2023 11:54:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM THERIAULT - VOLVO0010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ELTEC ELTEC 2FHL277LR0257\Swing Drive [VCP418879] 20 Oct 2023 @ 307.0 hrs

