
[[S50401772 PYP JURUPA]] VOLVO L90H 624450 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP434563
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: S50401772 PYP JURUPA

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: OSCAR DEL CAMPOoscar.delcampo@vcesvolvo.comT: (951)277-7620F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNlevel is low. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 10724530Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 06 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05996170 (Generated: 11/06/2023 18:26:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434563 VCP281675 --- ---Sample Date 05 Oct 2023 19 Aug 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 0 3651 --- ---Oil Hours 0 500 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 13.5 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 3.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 113 96 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 103 95 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 73 73 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 14 52 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 6 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 18 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 47 --- ---Copper ppm 14 3 --- ---Lead ppm 6 7 --- ---Tin ppm 2 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 24 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 49 17 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1579 1604 --- ---Magnesium ppm 476 664 --- ---Zinc ppm 1110 797 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 895 667 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 20 22 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 05996170 (Generated: 11/06/2023 18:26:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624450\Diesel Engine [VCP434563] 05 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

