
VOLVO A45G 352882 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435303
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: JASON MERRILLjmerrill@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)523-0822F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Exhaustvalve wear is indicated. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10724888Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 03 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 05996528 (Generated: 11/03/2023 14:48:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435303 VCP404187 VCP360546 VCP324732Sample Date 23 Oct 2023 13 Mar 2023 07 Jul 2022 23 Feb 2022Machine Hours 2584 1862 880 400Oil Hours 0 500 880 400Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.3 12.5 10.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 9.5 9.8 6.7Oxidation (PA) % 59 57 63 53
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.6 0.3 0.6 0.4Nitration (PA) % 64 57 73 76Sulfation (PA) % 54 53 58 51Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.5Silicon ppm 7 6 10 33Sodium ppm 0 4 1 2Potassium ppm 1 1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 11 21 35Copper ppm 8 22 13 50Lead ppm <1 <1 1 3Tin ppm <1 1 3 5Aluminum ppm <1 1 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 67 54 61 85Nickel ppm 5 3 1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1148 1094 1437 2273Magnesium ppm 911 776 709 32Zinc ppm 1220 1112 1224 1164Phosphorus ppm 1003 933 1002 1030Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 12 55 21 55

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 05996528 (Generated: 11/03/2023 14:48:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352882\Diesel Engine [VCP435303] 23 Oct 2023 @ 2584.0 hrs

