
[[X16401 SCHIDBERG]] VOLVO A40G 352199 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP359555
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: X16401 SCHIDBERG

WISE HEAVY EQUIPMENT9229 S 97TH STLA VISTA, NEUS  68128Contact: JASON HASSLERjhassler@wiseheavyequipment.comT: F: (402)597-0865
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0182Unique No: 10725307Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0182 [WUSCAR] 05996947 (Generated: 11/04/2023 12:10:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON HASSLER - VOLVO0182

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP359555 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 131 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 271 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 116 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 896 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 195 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0182 [WUSCAR] 05996947 (Generated: 11/04/2023 12:10:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON HASSLER - VOLVO0182
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352199\Front Axle [VCP359555] 26 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

