
VOLVO EC480EL 311334 - 1 SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP383176
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No:

LEONARDS CONTRACTING30850 STEPHENSON HWYMADISON HEIGHTS, MIUS  48071Contact: LARRY SCHRADElarry.schrade@sdevelop.comT: (810)499-1953F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: LEOMADUnique No: 10725311Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 03 Nov 2023
Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 05996951 (Generated: 11/03/2023 16:10:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP383176 VCP384128 --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 04 Jan 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 5780 4860 --- ---Oil Hours 0 500 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 144 124 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 8 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 3 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 38 78 --- ---Copper ppm <1 3 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 8 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 12 18 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 587 929 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 21 144 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 05996951 (Generated: 11/03/2023 16:10:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 311334\1 Swing Drive [VCP383176] 20 Oct 2023 @ 5780.0 hrs

