
[[10327 WALTERS]] VOLVO L150E 10327 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP435305
Oil Type: ATF
Job No: 10327 WALTERS

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: DAVE BOSTONdboston@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
Please confirm the lubricant tested inthis report is the correct lubricant forreplenishment of this system and issuggested by the OEM or overhaulfacility.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. The fluidviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10725366Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 07 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 05997006 (Generated: 11/08/2023 05:06:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BOSTON - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435305 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 18.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 53 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 14 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 168 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 74 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 05997006 (Generated: 11/08/2023 05:06:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BOSTON - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150E 10327\Transmission [VCP435305] 23 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

