
[[393457 KAISER]] VOLVO L70F 62326 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP410199
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 393457 KAISER

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY- BYRON CENTER8840 BYRON COMMERCE DR SWBYRON CENTER, MIUS  49315Contact: BRIAN RESERbrian.reser@altaequipment.comT: (616)878-7450F: (616)878-7650
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Clutch wear is indicated.High wear metal levels reflect thereported failure. There is a lightconcentration of water present in thefluid. The fluid is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0046Unique No: 10725886Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 05997526 (Generated: 11/07/2023 12:23:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRIAN RESER - VOLVO0046

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410199 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.225 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 57 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 284 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 98 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 97 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 199 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 146 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 76 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0046 [WUSCAR] 05997526 (Generated: 11/07/2023 12:23:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRIAN RESER - VOLVO0046
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70F 62326\Transmission [VCP410199] 20 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

