
[[SPM621372]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.3070 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP423198
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM621372

BELSON STEEL1685 N STATE RTE 50BOURBONNAIS, ILUS  60914Contact: M. POZANmpozan@belsonsteel.comT: (815)932-7416F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elevated aluminum (Al)and/or lead (Pb) and potassium (K)levels in your metals analysis arelikely a result of solder flux releaseinto the lubricant and is common onnew equipment/components. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: BELBOUUnique No: 10726087Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 06 Nov 2023
Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 05997727 (Generated: 11/06/2023 09:18:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP423198 VCP411398 VCP399523 VCP402111Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 11 Aug 2023 24 May 2023 20 Mar 2023Machine Hours 2632 2080 1562 1076Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.2 13.5 13.2 12.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 8.9 8.9 7.9Oxidation (PA) % 71 67 68 69
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 73 69 68 70Sulfation (PA) % 55 55 55 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 2.9Silicon ppm 3 3 4 4Sodium ppm 2 1 <1 0Potassium ppm 14 15 8 13
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 7 6 12Copper ppm 2 1 3 3Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 5 5 5 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 60 60 59 64Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1029 1074 1086 1158Magnesium ppm 1016 996 947 911Zinc ppm 1315 1245 1239 1286Phosphorus ppm 991 1004 986 1028Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 0 0 4 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 05997727 (Generated: 11/06/2023 09:18:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.3070\Diesel Engine [VCP423198] 27 Oct 2023 @ 2632.0 hrs

