
[[GROOT]] VOLVO L150H 6799 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP433148
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: GROOT

ALTA EQUIPMENT2500 WESTWARD DRSPRING GROVE, ILUS  60081Contact: JOHN DODGEjohn.dodge@altg.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ALTSPRUnique No: 10726650Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Nov 2023
Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05998290 (Generated: 11/06/2023 16:01:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN DODGE - ALTSPR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433148 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 232 --- --- ---Copper ppm 27 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3042 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1213 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1139 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 115 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05998290 (Generated: 11/06/2023 16:01:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN DODGE - ALTSPR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6799\Front Axle [VCP433148] 04 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

