
[[134741 INT TRANSFER]] ALJON 600 30135 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP434137
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 134741 INT TRANSFER

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: CHRIS BITNERCBitner@romco.comT: F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 10726664Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 06 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05998304 (Generated: 11/06/2023 11:12:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434137 VCP393303 VCP381212 VCP381211Sample Date 31 Oct 2023 18 Jan 2023 09 Dec 2022 09 Dec 2022Machine Hours 2223 512 184 184Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 294 326 340 309
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 2 1 1Sodium ppm <1 5 <1 2Potassium ppm 0 23 1 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 139 21 17 82Copper ppm 3 1 <1 4Lead ppm 0 4 0 0Tin ppm 0 1 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 99 16 2 10Magnesium ppm 0 11 0 0Zinc ppm 28 13 3 13Phosphorus ppm 897 260 915 917Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 186 23 168 154

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05998304 (Generated: 11/06/2023 11:12:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 600 30135\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP434137] 31 Oct 2023 @ 2223.0 hrs

