
[[GROOT]] VOLVO L150H 6799 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP433146
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: GROOT

ALTA EQUIPMENT2500 WESTWARD DRSPRING GROVE, ILUS  60081Contact: JOHN DODGEjohn.dodge@altg.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. Glycol andnitrite levels are acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: ALTSPRUnique No: 10726692Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 07 Nov 2023
Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05998332 (Generated: 11/08/2023 00:54:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN DODGE - ALTSPR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433146 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.95 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 748 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 51.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -38 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Green --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05998332 (Generated: 11/08/2023 00:54:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN DODGE - ALTSPR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6799\Coolant [VCP433146] 04 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

