
[[SWA400037 MULCH CENT]] VOLVO L90D 64482 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP339956
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA400037 MULCH CENT

ALTA EQUIPMENT2500 WESTWARD DRSPRING GROVE, ILUS  60081Contact: EVAN RICKERTevan.richert@altg.comT: (630)465-3464F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Tests donot reveal cause for reportedproblem.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ALTSPRUnique No: 10726695Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Nov 2023
Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05998335 (Generated: 11/06/2023 16:01:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVAN RICKERT - ALTSPR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP339956 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 26602 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 73 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 64 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 59 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 137 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 --- --- ---Copper ppm 14 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 47 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1542 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 634 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 964 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 748 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 79 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05998335 (Generated: 11/06/2023 16:01:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVAN RICKERT - ALTSPR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90D 64482\Diesel Engine [VCP339956] 30 Oct 2023 @ 26602.0 hrs

