
[[GORDRON AND GORDRON]] VOLVO EC350E 310732 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP409314
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: GORDRON AND GORDRON

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC MAINPO BOX 4500WESTBROOK, MEUS  04098Contact: BRENT MATCHETTmatchett@chadwick-baross.comT: F: (207)856-2995
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommendthat you drain the oil and perform afilter service on this component if notalready done. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition. Please note that there wastoo much water present in the oil toperform a viscosity test.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. Appearance is milky. There is ahigh concentration of glycol presentin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0006Unique No: 10727214Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 05998854 (Generated: 11/08/2023 12:13:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT MATCHETT - VOLVO0006

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409314 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 40 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONBase Number (BN) mg KOH/g 61.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 308 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 30.8 --- --- ---Soot % % 1.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 528 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 25 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.12 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 621 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 749 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 6 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 163 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1318 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 305 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 640 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 782 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 456 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 05998854 (Generated: 11/08/2023 12:13:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT MATCHETT - VOLVO0006
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 310732\Diesel Engine [VCP409314] 03 Nov 2023 @ 5000.0 hrs

