
VOLVO L110H VOLVO L110H (S/N NOT GIVEN) - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP413419
Oil Type: TDH FLUID SAE 75W80
Job No:

AARON GIBSON100 HUFFMAN RDBROKEN BOW, OKUS  74728Contact: AARON GIBSONaarongibson@hotmail.comT: (580)306-0203F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: AARBROUnique No: 10727739Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 07 Nov 2023
Report Id: AARBRO [WUSCAR] 05999379 (Generated: 11/07/2023 21:51:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AARON GIBSON - AARBRO

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413419 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 113 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3167 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1345 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1116 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 112 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: AARBRO [WUSCAR] 05999379 (Generated: 11/07/2023 21:51:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AARON GIBSON - AARBRO
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H VOLVO L110H (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Rear Axle [VCP413419] 05 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

